
O&G INDUSTRIES, INC.
GLASTONBURY RIVERFRONT PARK
PRJECT NO. GL-2013-22
O&G PROJECT NO. 224

5/29/2013 BID TABULATION SHEET

CONTRACTOR BASE BID ALTERNATE ALTERNATE ALTERNATE ALTERNATE ALTERNATE ALTERNATE ALTERNATE ALTERNATE ALTERNATE ALTERNATE ALTERNATE ALTERNATE ALTERNATE ALTERNATE ALTERNATE ALTERNATE 
BID PACKAGE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

BP-101 004100 004100 004100 004100 004100 004100 004100 004100 004100 004100 004100 004100 004100 004100 004100 004100
SITE 1A 1B 2A 2B 2C 2D 2E 2F 2G 3A 3B 4A 5A 6A 7A 7B

CONTRACTOR

Arborio Corporation 11,700,000.00             (90,000.00)$       (158,000.00)   (2,500.00)        (208,000.00)   (29,000.00)     (28,500.00)     (53,000.00)     (297,000.00)   (249,000.00)   (103,000.00)   (128,000.00)   (29,000.00)     (89,000.00)     (218,000.00)   (113,000.00)   (48,000.00)     

Richards Corporation 7,656,770.00               (92,072.50)$       (72,360.00)     (630.00)           (250,000.00)   (25,000.00)     (10,000.00)     (53,500.00)     (274,250.00)   (20,600.00)     No bid No bid (14,000.00)     $2,250.00 (143,281.50)   (30,238.50)     (15,736.00)     

C.J. Fucci, Inc. 7,399,222.00               (63,500.00)$       (190,000.00)   (15,500.00)     (52,000.00)     (31,500.00)     (27,000.00)     (55,000.00)     (97,658.00)     (65,000.00)     No bid No bid (34,000.00)     (50,000.00)     (48,000.00)     (116,000.00)   (43,450.00)     

Lawrence Brunoli, Inc. 6,534,000.00               (75,000.00)$       (125,000.00)   (7,500.00)        (50,000.00)     (15,000.00)     (10,000.00)     (10,000.00)     (35,000.00)     (20,000.00)     (15,000.00)     (25,000.00)     (15,000.00)     (37,500.00)     (85,000.00)     (56,000.00)     (60,000.00)     

Milton C. Beebe & Sons, Inc. 6,119,352.00               (11,570.00)$       (145,547.00)   (10,457.00)     No bid (72,947.00)     (24,225.00)     (52,500.00)     (130,494.00)   (140,294.00)   (4,062.00)        (16,250.00)     (31,450.00)     (25,245.00)     (131,198.00)   (58,035.00)     (33,883.00)     

CONTRACTOR BASE BID 
BID PACKAGE

BP-102
Building 

CONTRACTOR

Lawrence Brunoli, Inc. 5,207,000.00$             

Tomlinson Hawley Patterson 5,591,000.00$             

Sarazin General Contractors, Inc. 5,416,000.00$             

Noble Construction & Management 6,278,000.00$             

KBE Building Corporation 5,490,794.00$             

W.J. Mountford Co. 5,780,000.00$             
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