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BID #GL-2013-25

ANNUAL SIDEWALK PROGRAM

BID RECAP

ITEM EST. DADDONA CONSTR. DEREK & SONS DETOUR CONSTR’

NO DESCRIPTKJN QT UNIT UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION

1 New 5” Concrete Sidewalk 1 SF 29.55 29.55 8.00 8.00 5 99 5.99

2 New 5” Conc Sdwlk on Existing Base 1 SF 27.55 27.55 8.00 8.00 5.59 5.59

3 New 8” Reinforced Concrete Sidewalk 1 SF 34.10 34.10 900 9.00 7.89 7.89

4 Replacement 5” Concrete Sidewalk 1 SF 27.55 27.55 8.00 8.00 5.59 5.59

5 Replacement 8” Reinforced Conc. Walk 1 SF 31.90 31.90 8.50 8.50 7.24 7.24

6 New Pedestrian Ramp 1 EA 2600.00 2,600.00 700.00 700.00 499.00 499.00

7 Replacement Pedestrian Ramp 1 EA 2,400.00 2,400.00 700.00 700.00 479.00 479.00

8 Grading & Topsoil 1 SY 13.85 13.85 3.50 3.50 3.99 3.99

9 Turf Establishment 1 SY 1.50 1.50 1.00 1.00 1.99 1.99

10 Sedimentation Control System 1 LF 4.25 4.25 3.00 3.00 1.99 1.99

11 Sedimentation Control Sack 1 EA 1.50 1.50 No Bid 0.00 94.00 94.00

12 Permanent Driveway Repairs 1 SF 6.11 6.11 33.00 33.00 3.99 3.99

13 Tree Protection Trench 1 LF No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00

14 Tree Root Pruning/Barrier Installation 1 LF No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00

15 Sidewalk Raising 1 SF No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0,00 No Bid 0.00

TOTAL OF BID 5,177.86 1,482.00 1,116.26



0 .
BID #GL-2013-25

ANNUAL SIDEWALK PROGRAM

BID RECAP

ITEM EST MARTIN LAVIERO M & M CONSTRUCTION MDB CONSTRUCTION

NP.. DESCRIPTION Q]. JJJI UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION

1 New 5 Concrete Sidewalk 1 SF 750 750 8.00 8.00 12.50 12.50

2 New 5” Conc Sdwlk on Existing Base 1 SF 7.50 7.50 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00

3 New 8” Reinforced Concrete Sidewalk 1 SF 9.25 9.25 8.00 8.00 13.50 13.50

4 Replacement 5” Concrete Sidewalk 1 SF 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 7 00 7.00

5 Replacement 8” Reinforced Coric. Walk 1 SF 10.25 10.25 8.00 8.00 10.00 10.00

6 New Pedestrian Ramp 1 EA 750.00 750.00 850.00 850.00 2,000.00 2000.00

7 Replacement Pedestrian Ramp 1 EA 850.00 850.00 850 00 850.00 1300.00 1,300.00

8 Grading & Topsoil 1 SY 4.00 4.00 3.00 3.00 20.00 20.00

9 Turf Establishment 1 SY 5.00 5.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00

10 Sedimentation Control System 1 LF 200.00 200.00 3.00 3.00 4.00 4.00

11 Sedimentation Control Sack 1 EA 80.00 80.00 80.00 80.00 125.00 125.00

12 Permanent Driveway Repairs 1 SF 5.00 5.00 4.00 4.00 7.00 7.00

13 Tree Protection Trench 1 [F 20.00 20.00 10.00 10.00 No Bid 0.00

14 Tree Root Pruning/Barrier Installation 1 LF 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00 No Bid 0.00

15 Sidewalk Raising 1 SF 3.50 3.50 No Bid 0,00 No Bid 0.00

TOTAL OF BID 1,980.00 1,862.00 3,509.00



BID #GL-2013-25

ANNUAL SIDEWALK PROGRAM

BID RECAP

ITEM EST. PREVITI BROS. & SON PRINDLE HILL CONSTR. T & S CAMINITO

N DESCRIPTION QTY UNIF UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSkJN

1 New 5’ Concrete Sidewalk 1 SF 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50 6.25 6.25

2 New 5’ Conc Sdwlk on Existing Base 1 SF 8.25 8.25 7.35 7.35 6.30 6.30

3 New 8’ Reinforced Concrete Sidewalk I SF 7 50 7.50 9.75 9.75 7.25 7.25

4 Replacement 5” Concrete Sidewalk 1 SF 7.50 7.50 7.35 7.35 700 7.00

5 Replacement 8” Reinforced Conc. Walk 1 SF 825 8.25 9.60 9.60 8.25 8.25

6 New Pedestrian Ramp 1 EA 700.00 700.00 2,000.00 2,000.00 700.00 700.00

7 Replacement Pedestrian Ramp 1 EA 750.00 750.00 2,000.00 2,000.00 750.00 750.00

8 Grading & Topsoil 1 SY 6 00 6.00 3.00 3.00 5.00 5.00

9 TurfEstablishment 1 SY 1.75 1.75 2.00 2.00 1.25 1.25

10 Sedimentation Control System I LF 2.00 2.00 6.00 6.00 1.00 1.00

11 Sedimentation Control Sack 1 EA 120.00 120.00 1.50 1.50 90.00 90.00

12 Permanent Driveway Repairs 1 SF 3.75 3.75 4.25 4.25 3.00 3.00

13 Tree Protection Trench 1 LF 7.00 7.00 3 00 3.00 10.00 10.00

14 Tree Root Pruning/Barrier Installation 1 LF 15.00 15.00 3.00 3.00 70.00 70.00

15 Sidewalk Raising 1 SF No Bid 0.00 3.50 3.50 No Bid 0.00

TOTAL OF BID 1,644.50 4,067.80 1,665.30



C)
BID #GL-2013-25

ANNUAL SIDEWALK PROGRAM

BID RECAP

ITEM EST. T & T LANDSCAPING TABACCO & SON

NO, DESCRIPTION OTY UNIT UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION

1 New 5” Concrete Sidewalk 1 SF 850 850 775 7,75

2 New 5” Conc Sdwlk on Existing Base 1 SF 8.00 8.00 7.50 7.50

3 New 8” Reinforced Concrete Sidewalk 1 SF 11.00 11.00 8.50 8.50

4 Replacement 5” Concrete Sidewalk 1 SF 9.25 925 875 8.75

5 Replacement 8” Reinforced Conc. Walk 1 SF 11.75 1175 875 8.75

6 New Pedestrian Ramp 1 EA 1,150.00 1,15000 950.00 950.00

7 Replacement Pedestrian Ramp 1 EA 1,300.00 1,30000 950.00 950.00

8 Grading & Topsoil 1 SY 600 6.00 4.00 4.00

9 TurfEstablishment 1 SY 1.50 1.50 1.10 1.10

10 Sedimentation Control System 1 LF 4.50 4.50 3.00 3.00

11 Sedimentation Control Sack 1 EA 110.00 110.00 75.00 75.00

12 Permanent Driveway Repairs 1 SF 4.50 4.50 6.00 6.00

13 Tree Protection Trench 1 LF 17.50 17.50 6.00 6.00
14 Tree Root Pruning/Barrier Installation 1 LF 22.00 22 00 12 00 12.00

15 Sidewalk Raising 1 SF 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00

TOTAL OF BID 2,670.50 2,054.35


