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DESCRIPTION

New 5" Concrete Sidewalk

New 5" Wire-Reinforced Conc Sdwlk
New 8" Reinforced Concrete Sidewalk
Replacement 5" Concrete Sidewalk
Replacement 8" Reinforced Conc. Walk
New Pedestrian Ramp

Replacement Pedestrian Ramp
Grading & Topsoil

Turf Establishment

Sedimentation Control System
Sedimentation Control Sack
Permanent Driveway Repairs
Remove Bit/Replace w/5" Concrete
Tree Protection Trench

Tree Root Pruning/Barrier Installation
Sidewalk Raising

Mill/Resurface Spalled Sidewalk
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BID#GL-2011-25
ANNUAL SIDEWALK PROGRAM

BID RECAP

GEG

NEW

ENGLAND H.M.NUNES NUTMEG

CONC.

& SON

GRAVEL

ERIC
OCASIO
CONC.

PREVITI
BROS. &
SON

SUSAYA
CONSTR.

T&S
CAMINITO

TABACCO &
SON

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

DEREK& FREITAS CONSTRUC MARTIN

SONS  CONSTR.  TION  LAVIERO
7.50 7.50 8.00 7.50
7.75 8.00 8.25 7.75
8.00 10.00 11.00 9.50
8.00 7.00 7.80 8.50
9.00 10.00 12.00 1025
100000  1,000.00 850.00 750.00
120000  1,000.00 850.00 900.00
0.00 2.00 10.00 5.00
9.00 150 1.00 150
250 7.00 400 350.00
| 500]  100.00 150.00 75.00
' 15.00 10.00 430 4.00
| 2.25] 7.50 7.80 7.00
' 6.50 10.00 20.00 10.00
2200 10.00] 40.00 20.00
No Bid 40.00 5.00 3.60|

No Bid 35.00] 6.00] No Bid

mDenoteS lowest bid for that item

%% Denotes invalid bid
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7.00
7.40
9.40
7.50
10.00
1,000.00
1,100.00
5.00
1.50
5.50
90.00
3.50
7.40
16.00
22.00
No Bid
No Bid

5.60
6.00
8.60

9.20
1,150.00
1,250.00

4.50

4.00

90.00
4.50
6.10

12.50

20.00
6.50
9.75

7.70
8.65
11.55
11.70
15.55
1,160.00
1,660.00
24.20
1.10
7.00
210.00
6.35
12.45
21.65
16.00
No Bid
No Bid

8.50
8.50
9.75
9.50
11.50
1,400.00
1,400.00
9.00
2.00
2.00
65.00
3.95
8.50
20.00
25.00
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

10.00 6.25 7.50
10.50 6.30 7.75
11.50 8.00
10.25 7.00 8.25
12,50 8.25 8.50

850.00 700.00 650.00

900.00[ __ 750.00 750.00

8.00 6.00 2.25

5.00 1.50 2.00

4.00 1.00 3.00

120.00 100.00 65.00

a7s[____300] 28.00

10.00 6.50 8.25

40.00 1200[____450]

15.00 75.00 46.00

No Bid No Bid 4.00
No Bid No Bid No Bid



