Bid GL-2010-33 Annual Sidewalk Program

TOWN OF GLASTONBURY

Bid Opening 3-4-10 @ 11:00 a.m.

#1 #2 #3 #4 #5 #6 #7 #8 #9 #10 #11 #12

Vendor Unit Price | Unit Price | Unit Price | Unit Price | Unit Price | Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
SF SF SF SF SF Each Each Each Sq. Yd. Sq. Yd. Linear Ft. Each

Previti Bros. & Son $6.35 $6.50 $7.10 $7.15 $8.75 $745.00 $755.00 0 $6.50 $1.75 $0.30 $20

T&S Caminito Concrete $6.50 $6.55 $8.00 $8.00 $9.00 $700.00 $750.00 $200.00 $1.75 $2.00 $2.00 $150.00

Garofalo & Saraceno $6.50 $6.70 $8.00 $8.25 $9.50 $750.00 $800.00 0 $7.50 $2.00 $1.00 $75.00

GEG Construction $6.30 $6.50 $8.75 $6.40 $8.50 $850.00 $850.00 $500.00 $8.00 $0.75 $4.00 $130.00
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#13 #14 #15 #16 #17 #18 #19
Vendor Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit

Sq.Ft. Sq.Ft. L.F. L.F. Hour Sq.Ft. Sq.Ft.
Previti Bros. & Son $3.40 $6.75 $17.50 $30.00 $75.00 no bid no bid
T&S Caminito Concrete $3.00 $6.55 $15.00 $30.00 $75.00 no bid no bid
Garofalo & Saraceno $3.50 $7.00 $20.00 $25.00 $60.00 no bid no bid
GEG Construction $3.50 $6.50 $12.00 $4.50 $150.00 $6.00 $5.50




