BID OPENING DATA
GL-2010-03 Process Gravel Crushing Operation

Cavalier Guerrera Nutmeg BRD, LLC Fay & Wright Connecticut

VENDOR Industries Const. Co. Gravel & Crushing &
Excavating Recycling, LLC

Option #1 — 0 — 5,000 Tons
Without Town Supplied Loader (per ton) $5.17 No Bid $6.80 $6.50 $4.57 $2.98
0 -5,000 Tons
With Town Supplied Loader (per ton) $4.99 No Bid $6.30 N/A $4.23 $2.78
Days Required 1-5 10 30 4 15
5,001 - 10,000 Tons
Without Town Supplied Loader (per ton) $5.17 No Bid $5.49 $6.00 $4.07 $2.98
5,001 - 10,000 Tons
With Town Supplied Loader (per ton) $4.99 No Bid $4.99 N/A $3.73 $2.78
Days Required 5-10 15 45 4 15
10,001 — 15,000 Tons
Without Town Supplied Loader (per ton) $5.17 No Bid $4.79 $5.50 $3.57 $2.98
10,001 — 15,000 Tons
With Town Supplied Loader (per ton) $4.99 No Bid $4.29 N/A $3.23 $2.78
Days Required 10-15 20 60 4 15
Option #2
Lump Sum - Without Town Supplied
Loader (per ton) $120,000.00 $114,000.00 $89,480.00 | $175,000.00 $88,250.00 $49,499.00
Lump Sum — With Town Supplied Loader
(per ton) $99,950.00 $110,000.00 $74,480.00 N/A $79,250.00 $45,499.00
Days Required 15-20 20 25 90 12 15
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BID OPENING DATA
GL-2010-03 Process Gravel Crushing Operation

Hubert E. BCI, Inc. dba Herb Holden
VENDOR Butler Const. | Butler Co. Trucking
Option #1 — 0 — 5,000 Tons
Without Town Supplied Loader (per ton) $6.90 $6.95 No Bid
0 -5,000 Tons
With Town Supplied Loader (per ton) No Bid $5.95 No Bid
Days Required 8 5 No Bid
5,001 - 10,000 Tons
Without Town Supplied Loader (per ton) $6.40 $5.80 $4.39
5,001 - 10,000 Tons
With Town Supplied Loader (per ton) No Bid $4.80 3.88
Days Required 6 10 20
10,001 — 15,000 Tons
Without Town Supplied Loader (per ton) $6.40 $4.95 $4.39
10,001 — 15,000 Tons
With Town Supplied Loader (per ton) No Bid $3.95 $3.88
Days Required 6 15 25
Option #2
Lump Sum - Without Town Supplied
Loader (per ton) $114,700.00 $104,971.00 $74,500.00
Lump Sum — With Town Supplied Loader
(per ton) No Bid $84,971.00 $64,500.00
Days Required 24 45 25
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