Due Date/Time: 04/10/19 @ 11:00 a.m.

BID RECAP
GL-2019-30 - Facilities Maintenance Building Emergency Services Modifications

ITEM 1 ITEM 2 ITEM3 ITEMA4 ITEM 5 ITEM 6
BIDDER'SNAME | ieshel | (Bb, | T S | S | o | TOTA
Construction

Command Corporation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 16,749.38 No Bid 16,749.38
East Granby, CT

CT Carpentry Corp 122,000.00 12,600.00 10,800.00 15,500.00 3,400.00 3,400.00 167,700.00
Rocky Hill, CT

M.A. & M., Inc. 59,700.00 7,500.00 500.00 13,500.00 17,000.00 500.00 98,700.00
Middletown, CT

Zlotnick Construction, Inc. 130,319.00 38,462.00 39,735.00 30,814.00 36,814.00 13,715.00 289,859.00

Mansfield Center, CT
Diversity Construction Group, LLC 132,000.00 15,000.00 2,000.00 17,000.00 No Bid 2,000.00 168,000.00

Cheshire, CT

Awarded



